
 

 
 

Wolverine Execution Services (WEX) Taps OTC Markets Group for  
Real-Time Level 1+ OTC Equity Pricing Data 

 
NEW YORK – March 20, 2013 – OTC Markets Group (OTCQX: OTCM), operator of Open, 
Transparent and Connected financial marketplaces, today announced that Wolverine Execution 
Services (WEX), a premier technology and execution services provider to the financial industry, 
is offering OTC Markets Group's Level 1+ real-time pricing data on OTCQX®, OTCQB® and 
OTC Pink® securities to its customers.  
 
“With OTC Markets Group’s Level 1+ quotes, WEX’s institutional customers now have access to 
the real-time price and liquidity information they need to easily analyze, value and trade 
OTCQX, OTCQB and OTC Pink securities,” said Matthew Fuchs, Managing Director of Market 
Data & Strategy at OTC Markets Group.   
 
“Clients using the WEX Trading Platform (WTP) now have the ability to seamlessly access OTC 
Markets Group data,” said Tim Martin, WEX Head of Electronic Trading.  “As our client base 
continues to grow we have seen an increasing demand to view pricing data and trade a wider 
variety of products via WTP.”    
 
OTC Markets Group’s Level 1+ product provides real-time best bid/best offer and size data on 
OTCQX, OTCQB and OTC Pink securities.  It also offers real-time trade data from OTC Markets 
Group’s OTC Link® ATS, a U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission-registered Alternative 
Trading System, as well as information on individual securities.  The Level 1+ product is part of 
the company’s Real-Time+® product suite that provides investors and market professionals a 
complete actionable data-set for the trading of OTCQX, OTCQB and OTC Pink securities.   
 
About OTC Markets Group Inc. 
 
OTC Markets Group Inc. (OTCQX: OTCM) operates Open, Transparent and Connected 
financial marketplaces for 10,000 U.S. and global securities.  Through our OTC Link® ATS, we 
directly link a diverse network of broker-dealers that provide liquidity and execution services for 
a wide spectrum of securities.  We organize these securities into marketplaces to better inform 
investors of opportunities and risks – OTCQX®, The Best Marketplace with Qualified 
Companies; OTCQB®, The Venture Stage Marketplace with U.S. Reporting Companies; and 
OTC Pink®, The Open Marketplace with Variable Reporting Companies.  Our data-driven 
platform enables investors to easily trade through the broker of their choice at the best possible 
price and empowers a broad range of companies to improve the quality and availability of 
information for their investors.  To learn more about how we create better informed and more 
efficient financial marketplaces, visit www.otcmarkets.com. 

OTC Link ATS is operated by OTC Link LLC, member FINRA/SIPC and SEC regulated ATS. 
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